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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Spray Paints

TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2017)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 13, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

  UNIT

 OSHA PAINTS PRICE     

GROUP 1 16 oz. cans (12 oz. Net wt.) TOTAL         

84 ea. UNIT

Safety Orange PRICE 3.95 3.70 4.80 5.63

1. Krylon Part #K02410, Lawson No. 14560 TOTAL 331.80 310.80 403.20 472.92

300 ea. UNIT

Safety Red PRICE 3.95 4.99 4.50 5.63

2. Krylon Part #K02116, Lawson No. 14552 TOTAL 1,185.00 1,497.00 1,350.00 1,689.00

900 ea. UNIT

Safety Yellow PRICE 3.95 3.70 4.44 5.63

3. Krylon Part #K01813, Lawson No. 14554 TOTAL 3,555.00 3,330.00 3,996.00 5,067.00

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1 TOTAL 5,071.80 5,137.80 5,749.20 7,228.92

Price List Catalog Number  

 

 

Discount Off Price List (%)  

Multiplier for Discount  

Effective Date of Price List  

 

GROUP 1a INVERTED MARKING PAINT

 Water-Based 20 oz. cans (17 oz net wt.)

6,000 ea. UNIT

INVERTED WHTE KRYLON PRICE 2.45 2.69 2.77 3.37

1. Part #S03901, Lawson No. 14546 TOTAL 14,700.00 16,140.00 16,620.00 20,220.00

9,600 ea. UNIT

Fluorescent Caution Blue PRICE 2.45 2.69 2.77 3.37

2. Krylon Part #S03620, Lawson No. 14547 TOTAL 23,520.00 25,824.00 26,592.00 32,352.00

6,000 ea. UNIT

Fluorescent Safety Green PRICE 2.45 2.69 2.77 3.37

3. Krylon Part #S03630, Lawson No. 14548 TOTAL 14,700.00 16,140.00 16,620.00 20,220.00

480 ea. UNIT

Fluorescent Purple PRICE 2.45 2.69 2.79 3.37

4. Krylon Part #S03715, Lawson No. 14565 TOTAL 1,176.00 1,291.20 1,339.20 1,617.60
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Spray Paints

TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2017)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 13, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY S
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60 ea. UNIT

APWA Utility Yellow PRICE 2.45 2.69 3.03 3.37

5. Krylon Part #S03801, Lawson No. 14562 TOTAL 147.00 161.40 181.80 202.20

84 ea. UNIT

APWA Orange PRICE 2.45 2.69 2.97 3.37

6. Krylon Part #503905, Lawson No. 14549 TOTAL 205.80 225.96 249.48 283.08

   

      

 SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1a TOTAL 54,448.80 59,782.56 61,602.48 74,894.88

 

Price List Catalog Number

Discount Off Price List (%)

Multiplier for Discount

Effective Date of Price List

GROUP 1b INTERIOR/EXTERIOR INDUSTRIAL MAINTENANCE

 PAINTS, Spray Paint, Fast Drying

3. 16-oz. cans (12 oz net wt.)

600 ea. UNIT

Gloss Black PRICE 3.90 3.70 3.58 5.53

1. Krylon Part #K01601, Lawson No. 14555 TOTAL 2,340.00 2,220.00 2,148.00 3,318.00

600 ea. UNIT

Gloss White PRICE 3.90 3.70 4.36 5.53

2. Krylon Part #K01501, Lawson No. 14556 TOTAL 2,340.00 2,220.00 2,616.00 3,318.00

600 ea. UNIT

Regal Blue PRICE 3.90 3.60 3.58 5.53

3. Krylon Part #K01901, Lawson No. 14558 TOTAL 2,340.00 2,160.00 2,148.00 3,318.00

SUB TOTAL FOR GOUP 1b TOTAL 7,020.00 6,600.00 6,912.00 9,954.00

Price List Catalog Number

Discount Off Price List (%)
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Spray Paints

TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2017)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 13, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY S
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Multiplier for Discount

Effective Date of Price List

GROUP 1c TOUGH COAT ACRYLIC ALKYD ENAMELS

Spray Paint, Fast Drying

 16 oz. cans (12 oz. Net wt.)

48 ea. UNIT

OSHA Purple PRICE 3.25 3.40 3.67 4.36

1. Krylon Part #S01580, Lawson No. 14561 TOTAL 156.00 163.20 176.16 209.28

240 ea. UNIT

Primer Red PRICE 5.75 4.60 4.48 4.36

2. Rust-o-leum Part #V2169838, Lawson No. 15020 TOTAL 1,380.00 1,104.00 1,075.20 1,046.40

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1c TOTAL 1,536.00 1,267.20 1,251.36 1,255.68

Price List Catalog Number

Discount Off Price List (%)

Multiplier for Discount

Effective Date of Price List

GROUP 1d FARM & IMPLEMENT PAINTS

Spray Paint, Fast Drying

 16 oz. cans (12 oz. Net wt.)

240 ea. UNIT

John Deere/Green PRICE 3.99 3.80 4.50 5.62

1. Krylon Part #K01817, Lawson No. 14557 TOTAL 957.60 912.00 1,080.00 1,348.80

240 ea. UNIT

School Bus Yellow PRICE 3.99 3.80 4.50 5.62

2. Krylon Part #K01809, Lawson No. 14563 TOTAL 957.60 912.00 1,080.00 1,348.80

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1d TOTAL 1,915.20 1,824.00 2,160.00 2,697.60
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Spray Paints

TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2017)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 13, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY S
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Price List Catalog Number

Discount Off Price List (%)

Multiplier for Discount

Effective Date of Price List

GROUP 1e METALLIC PAINTS

Spray Paint, Fast Drying

 16 oz. cans (11 oz. Net wt.)

 960 ea. UNIT

Bright Silver PRICE 3.99 4.70 4.44 5.62

1. Krylon Part #K01401, Lawson No. 14553 TOTAL 3,830.40 4,512.00 4,262.40 5,395.20

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1e TOTAL 3,830.40 4,512.00 4,262.40 5,395.20

Price List Catalog Number

Discount Off Price List (%)

Multiplier for Discount

Effective Date of Price List

  

GROUP 1f WAND

  

120 ea. UNIT

Marking/Stripping Wand PRICE 16.60 16.59 18.16 27.29

1. Krylon Part No. K7096, Lawson No. 16134 TOTAL 1,992.00 1,990.80 2,179.20 3,274.80

    

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 1f TOTAL 1,992.00 1,990.80 2,179.20 3,274.80
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Spray Paints

TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2017)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 13, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY S
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GRAND TOTAL (GROUPS 1a-1f) TOTAL 75,814.20 81,114.36 84,116.64 104,701.08

GROUP 2 SURVEY STAKES AND FLAGS

 UNIT

 PRICE

1. ITEM DELETED TOTAL

1,000 ea. UNIT

Survey Flags-100 Flags per Bundle Flag Marking Blue Logo, PRICE 90.00 8.51

2. 4 IN X 5 IN X 24 IN wire stake blue with white logo, Lawson No. 12346 TOTAL NO BID NO BID 90,000.00 8,510.00

800 ea. UNIT

Survey Flags-100 Flags per Bundle Flag Marking Green Logo, PRICE 90.00 8.51

3. 4 IN X 5 IN X 24 IN wire stake green with black logo, Lawson No. 12347 TOTAL NO BID NO BID 72,000.00 6,808.00

500 ea. UNIT

Survey Flags-100 Flags per Bundle Flag Marking White Logo, PRICE 90.00 8.51

4. 4 IN X 5 IN X 24 IN wire stake white with black logo, Lawson No. 12349 TOTAL NO BID NO BID 45,000.00 4,255.00

500 ea. UNIT

Survey Flags-100 Flags per Bundle Flag Marking Purple Logo, PRICE 90.00 8.51

5. 4 IN X 5 IN X 24 IN wire stake purple with white logo, Lawson No. 46917 TOTAL NO BID NO BID 45,000.00 4,255.00

SUB TOTAL FOR GROUP 2 TOTAL NO BID NO BID 252,000.00 23,828.00

*

GRAND TOTAL (GROUP 2) TOTAL NO BID NO BID 252,000.00 23,828.00

EXTENSION 1 75,814.20 23,828.00

EXTENSION 2 75,814.20 23,828.00

EXTENSION 3 75,814.20 23,828.00

Net Net Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days 5 days 1-3 days 7-10 days

*LOW BIDDER
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BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Alamo Iron Works My Parts Plus Demandstar

Baytech Supply Pintura Paint Store SAWS Website

Blackburn Mfr. Pyramid School Products

Bullchase Roberts Painting

Dobie Supply Royall Matthiessen

Ferguson Safety Supply Inc.

Grainger Saf-T-Glove, Inc.

JP Painting Sherwin Williams

MSC Direct Sunbelt Mill Supply

6


